Republic of the Philippines

DEPARTMENT OF SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY V
ADVANCED SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY INSTITUTE

BAGONG PILIPINAS

07 November 2025

ASTI - BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
BAC Resolution No. 25-11-226

DECLARATION OF GLOBAL TRANSCO ICT SOLUTIONS AND TECHSOURCE COMPUTING SOLUTIONS,
INC. WITH THE SINGLE CALCULATED RESPONSIVE BIDS FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS SOFTWARE SUBSCRIPTIONS

GAA-25-08-21798 [KMD] | FASTRACROA-25-06-21525 | GAA-
25-06-21451 [STRIIDER] | GAA-25-07-21669 [KMD] | GAA-25-
07-21648 [SEKYU] | DOST-NAIRA-25-09-21928 [CSD] | GAA-

25-09-21907 [COMPASS] | GATES-25-09-21859 [SSED]

14 August 2025 | 04 July 2025 | 13 June 2025 | 24 July 2025 |

Purchase Request No.

Date of Purchase Request : 16 July 2025 | 16 September 2025 | 12 September 2025 | 05
September 2025

Invitation to Bid No. 1 25-09-5444

Solicitation No. 1 25-09-5444

PhilGEPS Reference No. 1 12443004

Approved Budget for the Contract :  P5,380,097.93

WHEREAS, Republic Act (RA) No. 12009, otherwise known as the “New Government Procurement Act
(NGPA)”, was enacted to modernize, harmonize, and streamline the public procurement system to promote
transparency, accountability, equity, efficiency, and economy in the government procurement process. Hence,
pursuant to Section 82 of RA 12009, it took effect on 13 August 2024, after its publication in the Official Gazette
and a newspaper of general circulation;

WHEREAS, the Government Procurement Policy Board (GPPB) subsequently approved and issued the
Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR) of RA 12009, providing the detailed guidelines, procedures, and
standard forms necessary for the operationalization of the Act;

WHEREAS, the Department of Science and Technology (DOST) - Advanced Science and Technology
Institute (ASTI) Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), through its BAC Secretariat and Procurement Management
Section (PMS), has conducted a review and orientation on the salient features, policy changes, and procedural
updates introduced under the new law and its IRR;

WHEREAS, a Memorandum dated 15 July 2025, the DOST-ASTI BAC started the implementation of RA
No. 12009 and its IRR as it recognizes the importance of ensuring compliance with the updated procurement
framework, as well as the the new standard forms, checklists, procedures, and documentary requirements
prescribed;

WHEREAS, Competitive Bidding, under Section 27 of RA No. 12009 and its IRR, is a method of
procurement open to any eligible and qualified bidder, wherein sealed bids are publicly invited, opened, and
evaluated to ensure transparency, competitiveness, and value for money in government transactions. Under the
IRR of RA 12009, Competitive Bidding shall be conducted when the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)
exceeds the prescribed thresholds, specifically: above Two Million Pesos (£2,000,000.00) for Goods and Services,
Infrastructure Projects, and Consulting Services;

WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC received the following Purchase Requests (PRs), together with market
studies:

PR No. GAA-25-08-21798 [KMD] dated 14 August 2025;

PR No. FASTRACROA-25-06-21525 dated 04 July 2025;

PR No. GAA-25-06-21451[STRIIDER] dated 13 June 2025;

PR No. GAA-25-07-21669 [KMD] dated 24 July 2025;

PR No. GAA-25-07-21648 [SEKYU] dated 16 July 2025;

PR No. DOST-NAIRA-25-09-21928 [CSD] dated 16 September 2025;
PR No. GAA-25-09-21907 [COMPASS] dated 12 September 2025; and
PR No. GATES-25-09-21859 [SSED]dated 05 September 2025;
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WHEREAS, items in the above PRs were included in the Fiscal Year 2025 Supplemental Annual
Procurement Plan Nos. 10, 13, 14, & 15 of the DOST-ASTI;

WHEREAS, the said PRs were consolidated into one (1) procurement opportunity, to be awarded per lot,
with a procurement project titled “Supply and Delivery of Various Software Subscriptions”, with a total ABC
amounting to Five Million Three Hundred Eighty Thousand Ninety-Seven Pesos and 93/100 Only
(P5,380,097.93), broken down as follows;

Lot No. ltem Description Quantity Unit UnitCost | ot :&““”
1 Subscription to Mathematical Computing 1 Lot P£3,885,522.93 £3,885,522.93
Environment Software
Online Subscription to Image Annotation and Model
2 Training 1 Lot £333,575.00 £333,575.00
Platform for Computer Vision Applications
3 Software - Slicer Software 1 Lot #16,500.00 #16,500.00
4 Subscription to PDF Editor 10 License 17,000.00 170,000.00
5 Subscription to Online Collaborative LaTeX Editor 1 Lot 106,200.00 106,200.00
6 Subscription to Genera_tl\_/e Artificial Intelligence 1 Lot 190,800.00 190,800.00
Productivity Tool
7 Subscription to Online 3D CAD, CAM, and CAE tool 1 Lot 43,000.00 43,000.00
8 Cloud-Based Computer Vision Ar_m_otation, Dataset 1 Lot 335,000.00 335,000.00
Management, and Model Training Program
9 Subscription to ICT Software (Al Agent) 1 Lot 20,000.00 20,000.00
10 Licensed-Based Subscription To UlI/UX Design 1 Lot 126,000.00 126,000.00
Platform
1 Llcensed-Base_d Subs_crlptlon to an Al 1 Lot 77.000.00 77.000.00
Coding Assistant

12 Licensed-Based Subscription to an API Platform 1 Lot 76,500.00 76,500.00
Grand Total P5,380,097.93

WHEREAS, on 29 September 2025, 09:00 AM, a Pre-procurement Conference was held online via
Microsoft Teams Application with the DOST-ATI BAC, Secretariat, and end-user representatives in attendance, to
determine the readiness of the procurement project;

WHEREAS, on 01 October 2025, the Invitation to Bid and the Philippine Bidding Documents (PBD) for said
procurement opportunity were published on the websites of the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement
System and DOST-ASTI, as well as in the latter’s conspicuous place reserved for the purpose, consistent with
Section 50 of RA No. 12009 and its IRR;

WHEREAS, Letters of Invitation were sent to three (3) witnesses and/or observers, namely:

1. Ms. Ma. Elena B. Deauna
State Auditor |1
Commission on Audit

2. Ms. Imelda S. Carrillo
President
Philippine Institute for Supply Management

3. Mr. Danny Royeca
Secretary General
Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry

WHEREAS, on 09 October 2025, 09:00 AM, a Pre-bidding Conference was conducted by the DOST-
ASTI BAC through videoconferencing, specifically via MS Teams, which was opened to prospective bidders, in
compliance with Section 51.1 of the RA No. 12009 and its IRR;

WHEREAS, only two (2) prospective bidders purchased and submitted PBDs prior to the deadline of

submission on 21 October 2025, 09:00 AM, particularly (1) Global Transco ICT Solutions and (2) Techsource
Computing Solutions, Inc.;
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WHEREAS, the bidders submitted bids for the following items:

1. Global Transco ICT Solutions

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Total Amount / ABC
4 Subscription to PDF Editor 10 License 17,000.00 170,000.00
GRAND TOTAL £170,000.00

2. Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc.

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Total Amount / ABC

Subscription to
1 Mathematical 1 Lot | P3,885522.93
Computing Environment

Software

£3,885,522.93

GRAND TOTAL £3,885,522.93

WHEREAS, on 21 October 2025, 09:30 AM, during the scheduled Opening of Bids, the DOST-ASTI BAC
opened the bids of Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. in public and in
the presence of the bidders’ representatives. Said Opening of Bids was conducted by the DOST-ASTI BAC through
a blended meeting arrangement;

WHEREAS, to determine the bidders’ compliance with the eligibility, technical, and financial requirements
specified in the DOST-ASTI PBD, the DOST-ASTI BAC examined the submitted documents of Global Transco
ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. versus a checklist of requirements. The DOST-ASTI

BAC used the non-discretionary “pass or fail” criterion;

WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC declared that Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource

Computing Solutions,

Inc.

were able

to submit

the

required

legal,

technical,

and financial

documents/requirements, thereby rating the technical component of the bids of Global Transco ICT Solutions
and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. as “passed”;

WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC opened the financial component of the bids of Global Transco ICT
Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. The bid amounts submitted by the bidders are as follows:

Lot
No.

Item Description

Qty.

Unit

ABC

Global Transco ICT Solutions,

Inc.

Techsource Computing Solutions,

Inc.

Unit Amount

Total Amount

Unit Amount

Total Amount

Unit Amount

Total Amount

Subscription to
Mathematical
Computing Environment
Software

Lot

$3,885,522.93

$3,885,522.93

NO BID

NO BID

£3,533,000.00

£3,533,000.00

Online Subscription to
Image Annotation and
Model Training Platform
for Computer Vision
Applications

Lot

£333,575.00

$333,575.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Software - Slicer Software

Lot

£16,500.00

£16,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Subscription to PDF
Editor

License

£17,000.00

£170,000.00

£11,858.86

£118,588.60

NO BID

NO BID

Subscription to Online
Collaborative LaTeX
Editor

Lot

£106,200.00

£106,200.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Subscription to
Generative
Atrtificial Intelligence
Productivity Tool

Lot

£190,800.00

£190,800.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Subscription to Online 3D
CAD,
CAM, and CAE tool

Lot

#43,000.00

#43,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Cloud-Based Computer
Vision
Annotation, Dataset
Management, and Model
Training Program

Lot

£335,000.00

#335,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Subscription to ICT
Software (Al
Agent)

Lot

£20,000.00

#20,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

10

Licensed-Based
Subscription to UlI/UX
Design Platform

Lot

£126,000.00

#126,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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Licensed-Based
11 Subscription to an Al 1 Lot £77,000.00 £77,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Coding Assistant
Licensed-Based
12 Subscription to an API 1 Lot £76,500.00 £76,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Platform
Total Bid Amount P118,588.60 £3,533,000.00

WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC conducted a detailed evaluation of the financial component of the bids
of Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. to establish the correct calculated

prices of the bids;

ABC Global Transco ICT Solutions, Techsource Computing

hgt Item Description Qty Unit Inc. Solutions, Inc.

' Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount

Subscription to
1 Mgg::mfr';a' 1 Lot | P3,885522.93 | P3,885522.93 NO BID NO BID £3,533,000.00 | P3,533,000.00
Environment Software
4 S“bscrg’gi‘t’;‘rto PDF 1 4o ""’:”s $17,000.00 P170,000.00 | P11,858.86 | P118,588.60 NO BID NO BID

Total Bid Amount P118,588.60 £3,533,000.00

WHEREAS, based on the results of the evaluation, the DOST-ASTI BAC found that Global Transco ICT
Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. submitted the Single Calculated Bids (SCB) for said
procurement project;

WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC declared Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing
Solutions, Inc. as the bidders with SCB, through BAC Resolution No. 25-10-213 dated 21 October 2025.
Likewise, in the same resolution, the DOST-ASTI BAC Secretariat was instructed by the DOST-ASTI BAC to assist
them in conducting post-qualification of said bidders;

WHEREAS, after verification, validation, and ascertainment of all statements made and documents
submitted by Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc., the DOST-ASTI BAC

determined that the submission of said bidders passed all the criteria for post-qualification, viz:

hgt. Item Description Name of Bidder %:&T:ezs Ranking
Subscription to Mathematical Techsource Computing Single Calculated
1 Computing Environment Solutions. Inc £3,533,000.00 Responsive Bid
Software T (SCRB)
4 | Subscription to PDF Editor G'%ba' Transco ICT P£118,588.60 SCRB
olutions, Inc.

NOW, THEREFORE, FOR AND IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING, WE, the members of the
DOST-ASTI BAC hereby resolve to:

1. Declare Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc., as the bidder with SCRB, for the Supply and Delivery
of One (1) Lot Subscription to Mathematical Computing Environment Software, with a total bid price
amounting to Three Million Five Hundred Thirty-Three Thousand Pesos Only (P3,533,000.00), inclu-
sive of all government taxes, other fees and charges;

2. Declare Global Transco ICT Solutions, as the bidder with SCRB, for the Supply and Delivery of Ten
(10) License Subscription to PDF Editor with a total bid price amounting to One Hundred Eighteen
Thousand Five Hundred Eighty-Eight Pesos and 60/100 Only (P118,588.60), inclusive of all govern-
ment taxes, other fees and charges;

3. Recommend to the DOST-ASTI Director, as the Head of the Procuring Entity (HOPE), that the contracts
be awarded to Global Transco ICT Solutions and Techsource Computing Solutions, Inc. in the
above-mentioned amounts; and

4. Recommend the approval of the HOPE of the foregoing results.

RESOLVED, in Quezon City, this 7" day of November 2025.

Digitally signed
by Serrano Paul

PAUL JOHN M SERHERY!2

End-user
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Digitally signed
by Girlie D.
Fernandez




Digitally signed
by Meryl Regine
Algodon
MERYL REGINE L. ALGODON, Ph.D.
BAC Member
Digitally signed by
Raro Ramon Vann
Cleff Bornales
RAMON VANN CLEFF B. RARO
BAC Member

9’_ Digitally sigrlmed by
Tetangco Jelina
for W TanyagHidaIgo
JEFFREY A. ABOROT
BAC Chairperson

APPROVED/)ISAPPROVED:

Digitally

F E EEEORDPY.Be
Dipgctor, DOSTPREENZ
Asunta

/bac-sec/sdda/kbr

Page 5 of 5

Digitally signed
by Martinez

PHILIP A. MARTINEZ

BAC Member
Digitally signed by
%7«/ Tetangco Jelina
Tanya Hidalgo
JELINA TANYA H. TETANGCO
BAC Vice Chairperson
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