
ASTI – FM 03-13 

REV 4 / 10 June 2025 

 
ASTI – BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE 

BAC Resolution No. 25-08-154 

(1) RECOMMENDING THE POST-DISQUALIFICATION OF 3TECH INNOVATION MASTER CORPORATION 
FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ONE (1) UNIT OF UNINTERRUPTED POWER SUPPLY AND 
TWENTY-FIVE (25) UNITS OF LAPTOP (WITH SOFTWARE LICENSE AND ACCESSORIES) AND 

RECOMMENDING POST QUALIFICATION OF THE SECOND LOWEST CALCULATED BID 
(2) DECLARATION OF THE 3TECH INNOVATION MASTER CORPORATION AND JASSEN HARRIS 

INDUSTRIES CORP. WITH SINGLE /LOWEST CALCULATED RESPONSIVE BID FOR THE 
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS COMPUTER PERIPHERALS AND WORKSTATIONS 

 

Purchase Request No. : 
PROPEL-25-04-21033 (RDD) | GATES-25-06-21425 (SSED) | 
GAA-25-06-21443 (FAD) 

Date of Purchase Request : 11 April 2025 | 03 June 2025 | 10 June 2025 

Invitation to Bid No. : 25-77-2025 

Solicitation No. : 25-77-2025 

PhilGEPS Reference No. : 12206964 

Approved Budget for the Contract : ₱5,002,320.00 

 
WHEREAS, the Republic Act (RA) No. 9184, otherwise known as the “Government Procurement Reform 

Act”, provides that all procurement of the national government, its departments, bureaus, offices, and agencies, 
including state universities and colleges, government-owned and/or controlled corporations, government financial 
institutions and local government units, shall, in all cases be conducted in accordance therewith and its 2016 
revised Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR); 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) of the Department of Science and 

Technology (DOST) - Advanced Science and Technology Institute (ASTI) received the following Purchase 
Requests (PRs), together with market studies: 

 
1) PR No. PROPEL-25-04-21033 (RDD) dated 11 April 2025; 
2) PR No. GATES-25-06-21425 (SSED) dated 03 June 2025; and 
3) PR No. GAA-25-06-21443 (FAD) dated 10 June 2025; 

 
WHEREAS, items in the above PRs were included in the Fiscal Year 2025 Supplemental Annual 

Procurement Plan – Common-Use Supplies and Equipment Nos. 7, 8, 9 & 10 of the DOST-ASTI; 
 

WHEREAS, the said PRs were consolidated into one (1) procurement opportunity, to be awarded per lot, 
with a procurement project titled “Supply and Delivery of Various Computer Peripherals and Workstations”, 
with a total Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) amounting to Five Million Two Thousand Three Hundred 
Twenty Pesos Only (₱5,002,320.00), broken down as follows: 

 

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost 
Total Amount / Approved 
Budget for the Contract 

(ABC) 

1 Wireless Mechanical Keyboard 14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 

2 
All-in-One Desktop Personal 

Computer 3 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱149,970.00 

3 Uninterrupted Power Supply 1 Unit ₱6,000.00 ₱6,000.00 

4 Colored Printer 1 Unit ₱27,000.00 ₱27,000.00 

5 Laptops 15 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱749,850.00 

6 
Procurement of One (1) Unit 

Laptop for Administrative 
1 Unit ₱80,000.00 ₱80,000.00 

7 LCD Monitor 25 Unit ₱25,000.00 ₱625,000.00 

8 Accessory - Laptop Stand 27 Unit ₱900.00 ₱24,300.00 

9 Portable Speaker 2 Unit ₱42,200.00 ₱84,400.00 

10 Accessory - Extension Cord 10 Piece ₱1,900.00 ₱19,000.00 
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11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 USB C 

Hub 25 Piece ₱6,000.00 ₱150,000.00 

12 
Laptop (with software license 

and accessories) 
25 Unit ₱120,000.00 ₱3,000,000.00 

GRAND TOTAL ₱5,002,320.00 

 

WHEREAS, on 07 July 2025, 09:00 AM, a Pre-procurement Conference was held online via Microsoft 
Teams Application with the DOST-ATI BAC, Secretariat, and end-user representatives in attendance, to 
determine the readiness of the procurement project; 

 
WHEREAS, on 10 July 2025, the Invitation to Bid and the Philippine Bidding Documents (PBD) for said 

procurement opportunity were published on the websites of the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement 
System and DOST-ASTI, as well as in the latter’s conspicuous place reserved for the purpose, consistent with 
Section 21, Rule VII of the 2016 revised IRR of RA No. 9184; 

 
WHEREAS, Letters of Invitation were sent to three (3) witnesses and/or observers, namely: 

 
(1) Ms. Ma. Elena B. Deauna 

State Auditor II 
Commission on Audit 

 
(2) Ms. Imelda S. Carrillo 

President 
Philippine Institute for Supply Management 

 
(3) Mr. Danny Royeca 

Secretary General 
Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry 

 
WHEREAS, on 17 July 2025, 09:00 AM, a Pre-bidding Conference was conducted by the DOST-ASTI 

BAC through videoconferencing, specifically via MS Teams, which was opened to prospective bidders, in 
compliance with Section 22.1, Rule VII of the 2016 revised IRR of RA No. 9184; 

 
WHEREAS, on 24 July 2025, the DOST-ASTI BAC issued a Notice on the issuance of supplemental bid 

bulletin, as its original issuance date of 22 July 2025 was affected by the suspension of work in government offices 
and classes at all levels in Metro Manila and 36 other areas from 22 to 23 July 2025, as declared by Malacañang 
Palace due to continued heavy rainfall brought about by the Southwest Monsoon (Habagat), upon the 
recommendation of the National Disaster Risk Reduction and Management Council; 

 
WHEREAS, on the same day, the DOST-ASTI BAC issued Supplemental Bid Bulletin No. BAC-2025- 

07-010 on 24 July 2025, amending several provisions in the DOST-ASTI PBD, as well as answering the queries 
of the prospective bidders; 

 
WHEREAS, in said supplemental bid bulletin, the DOST-ASTI BAC likewise rescheduled the Opening of 

Bids from 29 July 2025 to 31 July 2025; 

 
WHEREAS, two (2) prospective bidders purchased and submitted PBDs prior to the deadline of 

submission on 31 July 2025, 09:00 AM, particularly (1) 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and (2) Jassen 
Harris Industries Corp.; 

 
WHEREAS, the bidders submitted bids for the following items: 

 
(1) 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation. 

 

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Total Amount / ABC 

1 Wireless Mechanical Keyboard 14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 

2 
All-in-One Desktop Personal 

Computer 3 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱149,970.00 

3 Uninterrupted Power Supply 1 Unit ₱6,000.00 ₱6,000.00 

5 Laptops 15 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱749,850.00 

12 
Laptop (with software license 

and accessories) 
25 Unit ₱120,000.00 ₱3,000,000.00 

Grand Total ₱3,992,620.00 
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(2) Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 
 

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Total Amount / ABC 

1 Wireless Mechanical Keyboard 14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 

3 Uninterrupted Power Supply 1 Unit ₱6,000.00 ₱6,000.00 

4 Colored Printer 1 Unit ₱27,000.00 ₱27,000.00 

9 Portable Speaker 2 Unit ₱42,200.00 ₱84,400.00 

10 Accessory - Extension Cord 10 Piece ₱1,900.00 ₱19,000.00 

11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 USB C 

Hub 
25 Piece ₱6,000.00 ₱150,000.00 

Grand Total ₱373,200.00 

 
WHEREAS, on 31 July 2025, 09:30 AM, during the scheduled Opening of Bids, the DOST-ASTI BAC 

opened the bids of 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp. in public and in 
the presence of the representatives of the bidders. Said Opening of Bids was conducted by the DOST-ASTI BAC 
through a blended meeting arrangement; 

 
WHEREAS, to determine the compliance of the bidders with the eligibility, technical, and financial 

requirements specified in the DOST-ASTI PBD, the DOST-ASTI BAC examined the submitted documents of 3Tech 
Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp. versus a checklist of requirements. The 
DOST-ASTI BAC used the non-discretionary “pass or fail” criterion; 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC declared that 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen 

Harris Industries Corp. were able to submit the required legal, technical, and financial documents/requirements, 
thereby rating the technical component of the bids of 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris 
Industries Corp. as “passed”; 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC opened the financial component of the bids of 3Tech Innovation 

Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp. The bid amounts submitted by the bidder are as follows: 
 

Lot 
No. 

 
Item Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

ABC 
3Tech Innovation Master 

Corporation 
Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 

1 
Wireless Mechanical 

Keyboard 
14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 ₱3,650.00 ₱48,300.00 ₱5,988.00 ₱83,832.00 

2 

All-in-One Desktop 
Personal 
Computer 

3 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱149,970.00 ₱45,300.00 ₱135,900.00 NO BID NO BID 

3 
Uninterrupted Power 

Supply 
1 Unit ₱6,000.00 ₱6,000.00 ₱4,300.00 ₱4,300.00 ₱5,335.00 ₱5,335.00 

4 Colored Printer 1 Unit ₱27,000.00 ₱27,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱26,980.00 ₱26,980.00 

5 Laptops 15 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱749,850.00 ₱49,500.00 ₱742,500.00 NO BID NO BID 

6 
Procurement of One (1) 

Unit 
Laptop for Administrative 

1 Unit ₱80,000.00 ₱80,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

7 LCD Monitor 25 Unit ₱25,000.00 ₱625,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

8 Accessory - Laptop Stand 27 Unit ₱900.00 ₱24,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

9 Portable Speaker 2 Unit ₱42,200.00 ₱84,400.00 NO BID NO BID ₱41,850.00 ₱83,700.00 

10 
Accessory - Extension 

Cord 
10 Piece ₱1,900.00 ₱19,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱1,815.00 ₱18,150.00 

11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 

USB C 
Hub 

25 Piece ₱6,000.00 ₱150,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱5,150.00 ₱128,750.00 

12 
Laptop (with software 

license 
and accessories) 

25 Unit ₱120,000.00 ₱3,000,000.00 ₱113,000.00 ₱2,825,000.00 NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL BID AMOUNT ₱3,756,000.00 ₱346,747.00 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC conducted a detailed evaluation of the financial component of the bids 

of 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp. to establish the correct calculated 
prices of the bids; 

 

Lot 
No. 

 
Item Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

ABC 
3Tech Innovation Master 

Corporation 
Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 
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1 
Wireless Mechanical 

Keyboard 
14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 ₱3,650.00 ₱51,100.00 ₱5,988.00 ₱83,832.00 

2 
All-in-One Desktop 

Personal 
Computer 

3 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱149,970.00 ₱45,300.00 ₱135,900.00 NO BID NO BID 

3 
Uninterrupted Power 

Supply 
1 Unit ₱6,000.00 ₱6,000.00 ₱4,300.00 ₱4,300.00 ₱5,335.00 ₱5,335.00 

4 Colored Printer 1 Unit ₱27,000.00 ₱27,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱26,980.00 ₱26,980.00 

5 Laptops 15 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱749,850.00 ₱49,500.00 ₱742,500.00 NO BID NO BID 

6 
Procurement of One (1) 

Unit 
Laptop for Administrative 

1 Unit ₱80,000.00 ₱80,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

7 LCD Monitor 25 Unit ₱25,000.00 ₱625,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

8 Accessory - Laptop Stand 27 Unit ₱900.00 ₱24,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

9 Portable Speaker 2 Unit ₱42,200.00 ₱84,400.00 NO BID NO BID ₱41,850.00 ₱83,700.00 

10 
Accessory - Extension 

Cord 
10 Piece ₱1,900.00 ₱19,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱1,815.00 ₱18,150.00 

11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 

USB C 
Hub 

25 Piece ₱6,000.00 ₱150,000.00 NO BID NO BID ₱5,150.00 ₱128,750.00 

12 
Laptop (with software 

license 
and accessories) 

25 Unit ₱120,000.00 ₱3,000,000.00 ₱113,000.00 ₱2,825,000.00 NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL BID AMOUNT ₱3,758,800.00 ₱346,747.00 

 
WHEREAS, after due evaluation, the DOST-ASTI BAC and end-user unit found the submission of 3Tech 

Innovation Master Corporation to be complete, but with arithmetical corrections. The corrected bid 3Tech 
Innovation Master Corporation is Three Million Seven Hundred Fifty-Eight Thousand Eight Hundred Pesos 
Only (₱3,758,800.00); 

 
WHEREAS, Section 34.4 of the 2016 revised IRR of RA No. 9184 provides: 

 
“If the BAC determines that the bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid/Highest Rated Bid passes 
all the criteria for post-qualification, it shall declare the said bid as the LCRB or HRRB, and 
recommend to the HoPE the award of contract to the said bidder at its submitted bid price or its 
calculated bid price, whichever is lower or, in the case of quality-based evaluation procedure, 
submitted bid price or its negotiated price, whichever is lower.” 

 
WHEREAS, based on the results of the evaluation and adopting Section 34.4 of the 2016 revised IRR of 

RA No. 9184, the DOST-ASTI BAC found that 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris 
Industries Corp. submitted the Single and/or Lowest Calculated Bids for said procurement project; 

 
Lot 
No. 

Item Description Name of Bidder 
Bid Price as 

Calculated (₱) 
Ranking 

 
1 

 
Wireless Mechanical Keyboard 

 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 

 
48,300.00 

Lowest 

Calculated Bid 

(LCB) 

Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 83,832.00 2nd LCB 

 
2 

All-in-One Desktop Personal 

Computer 

 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 

 
135,900.00 

Single 

Calculated Bid 

(SCB) 

3 Uninterrupted Power Supply 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 4,300.00 LCB 

Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 5,335.00 2nd LCB 

4 Colored Printer Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 26,980.00 SCB 

5 Laptops 3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 742,500.00 SCB 

6 
Procurement of One (1) Unit 

Laptop for Administrative NO BID NO BID NO BID 

7 LCD Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID 

8 Accessory - Laptop Stand NO BID NO BID NO BID 

9 Portable Speaker Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 83,700.00 SCB 

10 Accessory - Extension Cord Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 18,150.00 SCB 

11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 USB C 

Hub 
Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 128,750.00 SCB 

12 
Laptop (with software license 

and accessories) 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 2,825,000.00 SCB 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC declared 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris 

Industries Corp. as the bidders with Single and Lowest Calculated Bid (SCB & LCB), through BAC Resolution 
No. 25-07-144 dated 31 July 2025. Likewise, in the same resolution, the DOST-ASTI BAC Secretariat was 
instructed by the DOST-ASTI BAC to assist them in conducting post-qualification of said bidders; 
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WHEREAS, on 18 August 2025, 9:00 AM, the DOST-ASTI BAC and its Secretariat, conducted the Post- 
Qualification for the aforementioned procurement project. Upon review of the Post-Qualification Form submitted 
by the end-users, it was noted that several technical specifications were not met, particularly for Lot Nos. 3 and 
12; 

 
WHEREAS, the DOST-ASTI BAC declared Lot Nos. 3 and 12 as “post-disqualified.” Furthermore, the 

DOST-ASTI BAC recommended to conduct post-qualification of the second Lowest Calculated Bidder for Lot No. 
3, considering that there was no second lowest bidder for Lot No. 12; 

 
WHEREAS, after verification, validation, and ascertainment of all statements made and documents 

submitted by 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp., the DOST-ASTI BAC 
determined that the submission of said bidder passed all the criteria for post-qualification, viz.: 

 
Lot 
No. Item Description Name of Bidder 

Bid Price as 
Calculated (₱) Ranking 

 
1 

 
Wireless Mechanical Keyboard 

 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 

 
48,300.00 

Lowest 

Calculated 

Responsive Bid 

(LCRB) 

 
2 

 
All-in-One Desktop Personal 

Computer 

 
3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 

 
135,900.00 

Single 

Calculated 

Responsive Bid 

(SCRB) 

4 Colored Printer Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 26,980.00 SCRB 

5 Laptops 3-Tech Innovation Master Corp. 742,500.00 SCRB 

9 Portable Speaker Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 83,700.00 SCRB 

10 Accessory - Extension Cord Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 18,150.00 SCRB 

11 
Cable Assembly - 11in1 USB C 

Hub 
Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 128,750.00 SCRB 

 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, FOR AND IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING, WE, the members of the 

DOST-ASTI BAC hereby resolve to: 
 

1. Declare 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation as the bidder with SCRB and LCRB, for the Supply and 
Delivery of Fourteen (14) Unit Wireless Mechanical Keyboard and Other Items with a total bid price 

amounting to Nine Hundred Twenty-Six Thousand Seven Hundred Pesos Only (₱926,700.00), 
broken down as follows: 

 

Lot 
No. 

 
Item Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

ABC 
3Tech Innovation Master 

Corporation 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 

1 
Wireless 

Mechanical 
Keyboard 

14 Unit ₱6,200.00 ₱86,800.00 ₱3,650.00 ₱48,300.00 

 
2 

All-in-One 

Desktop Personal 
Computer 

 
3 

 
Unit 

 
₱49,990.00 

 
₱149,970.00 

 
₱45,300.00 

 
₱135,900.00 

5 Laptops 15 Unit ₱49,990.00 ₱749,850.00 ₱49,500.00 ₱742,500.00 

Total Bid Amount ₱926,700.00 

 
2. Declare Jassen Harris Industries Corp., as the bidder with SCRB, for the Supply and Delivery of One 

(1) Unit Colored Printer and Other Items with a total bid price amounting to Two Hundred Fifty-Seven 

Thousand Five Hundred Eighty Pesos Only (₱257,580.00), broken down as follows; and 
 

Lot 

No. 
Item Description Quantity Unit 

ABC Jassen Harris Industries Corp. 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 

4 Colored Printer 1 Unit ₱27,000.00 ₱27,000.00 ₱26,980.00 ₱26,980.00 

9 Portable Speaker 2 Unit ₱42,200.00 ₱84,400.00 ₱41,850.00 ₱83,700.00 

10 
Accessory - 

Extension Cord 
10 Piece ₱1,900.00 ₱19,000.00 ₱1,815.00 ₱18,150.00 

11 
Cable Assembly - 
11in1 USB C -Hub 25 Piece ₱6,000.00 ₱150,000.00 ₱5,150.00 ₱128,750.00 

Total Bid Amount ₱257,580.00 
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3. Post-Disqualify 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation for the Supply and Delivery of One (1) Unit 
Uninterrupted Power Supply due to non-compliance with the required technical specifications and proceed 
with the conduct of post-qualification of documents submitted by Jassen Harris Industries Corp. as the 
second LCB for the Item No. 3, and the same to submit its Income and Business Tax Returns filed and 
paid through BIR Electronic Filing and Payments System within six (6) months preceding the date of bid 
submission within a non-extendible period of five (5) calendar days upon receipt of the Post Qualification 
Notice; 

 
4. Post-Disqualify 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation for the Supply and Delivery of Twenty-Five (25) 

Units of Laptop (with software license and accessories) and repost for another procurement opportunity. 
 

5. Recommend to the DOST-ASTI Director, as the Head of the Procuring Entity (HoPE), that the contracts 
be awarded to 3Tech Innovation Master Corporation and Jassen Harris Industries Corp. in the above- 
mentioned amounts; and 

 
6. Recommend the approval of the HoPE of the foregoing results. 

 
 

RESOLVED, in Quezon City, this 18th day of August 2025. 

 

Digitally signed by 

Alvin E. Retamar 

ALVIN E. RETAMAR 

Digitally signed 

by Cayaban 

May Celicious 

MAY C. CAYABAN 
End-user Digitally signed 

by Lumauig 
Maricar Racho 

End-user 

 
Digitally signed 
by Martinez 
Philip Abela 

Digitally 

signed by De 

Leon Ronith 

Ann Magaling 

MERYL REGINE L. ALGODON, Ph.D. 
BAC Member 

 
 
 

RAMON VANN CLEFF B. RARO 
BAC Member 

PHILIP A. MARTINEZ 
BAC Member 

Digitally signed by 

Jarina Jaymar Luansing 

Date: 2025.08.18 

15:48:12 +08'00' 

JAYMAR L. JARINA 
BAC Member 

 

 

JELINA TANYA H. TETANGCO 

BAC Vice Chairperson 
JEFFREY A. ABOROT 

BAC Chairperson 

 
APPROVED/DISAPPROVED: 

 
 
 

 
FRANZ A. DE LEON, Ph.D. 

Director, DOST-ASTI 
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