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Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost 
Total Amount / Approved 
Budget for the Contract 

(ABC)

1
Local Transport - University of 
the Philippines (UP) Miagao 

50Mbps
7 Month 28,794.15 201,559.05

2
Local Transport - UP Mintal 
Mindanao Primary 10Mbps 7 Month 15,000.00 105,000.00

3
Local Transport - UP Koronadal 

2Mbps
7 Month 43,527.00 304,689.00

4
International Private Line (IPL) -

Singapore (SG) 10Gbps 7 Month 1,659,671.55 11,617,700.85

GRAND TOTAL 12,228,948.90

WHEREAS, on 07 May 2025, 09:00 AM, a Pre-bidding Conference for said procurement was conducted 
by the DOST-ASTI BAC through videoconferencing via MS Teams, which was opened to prospective bidders, in 
compliance with Section 22.1, Rule VII of the 2016 revised IRR of RA No. 9184;

WHEREAS, as a result of the discussion and clarifications made during the Pre-bidding Conference, the 
DOST-ASTI BAC issued Supplemental Bid Bulletin No. BAC-2025-05-003 on 13 May 2025, answering the 
queries of the prospective bidders;

02 June 2025



 
 

 
 
WHEREAS, Eastern Telecommunications Philippines, Inc. submitted bid for Lot No. 4 Only, while 

Converge ICT Solutions, Inc. submitted bids for Lot Nos. 2 & 4 Only, viz: 
 

Lot No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost  Total Amount / ABC 

2 
Local Transport - UP Mintal  
Mindanao Primary 10Mbps 

7 Month 15,000.00 105,000.00 

4 IPL  SG 10Gbps 7 Month 1,659,671.55 11,617,700.85 

Grand Total 11,722,700.85 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

Lot 
No. Item Description Quantity Unit 

ABC 
Eastern 

Telecommunications 
Philippines, Inc.  

Converge ICT Solutions, Inc. 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 

1 
Local Transport  

UP Miagao 50Mbps 
7 Month 28,794.15 201,559.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

2 

Local Transport  
UP Mintal 

Mindanao Primary 
10Mbps 

7 Month 15,000.00 105,000.00 NO BID NO BID 9,164.00 64,148.00 

3 
Local Transport  

UP Koronadal 2Mbps 7 Month 43,527.00 304,689.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

4 IPL - SG 10Gbps 7 Month 1,659,671.55 11,617,700.85 1,232,000.00 8,624,000.00 492,157.43 3,445,102.00 

TOTAL BID AMOUNT 8,624,000.00 3,509,250.00 

 

 
 

Lot 
No. Item Description Quantity Unit 

ABC 
Eastern 

Telecommunications 
Philippines, Inc. 

Converge ICT Solutions, Inc. 

Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount Unit Amount Total Amount 

2 
Local Transport  

UP Mintal 
Mindanao Primary 

7 Month 15,000.00 105,000.00 NO BID NO BID 9,164.00 64,148.00 



10Mbps

4 IPL - SG 10Gbps 7 Month 1,659,671.55 11,617,700.85 1,232,000.00 8,624,000.00 492,157.43 3,445,102.01

TOTAL BID AMOUNT 8,624,000.00 3,509,250.01

Lot 
No. Item Description Name of Bidder

Bid Price as 
Calculated Ranking

2
Local Transport - UP Mintal 
Mindanao Primary 10Mbps

Converge ICT 
Solutions, Inc. 

64,148.00
Single

Calculated Bid (SCB)

4 IPL - SG 10Gbps Converge ICT
Solutions, Inc. 

3,445,102.00 Lowest
Calculated Bid (LCB)

Lot No. Description
Name of
Bidder

Bid Amounts/Prices as Calculated
Result

Unit Amount Total Amount

2 Local Transport - UP Mintal 
Mindanao Primary 10Mbps Converge ICT 

Solutions, Inc. 

9,164.00 64,148.00
Single Calculated
Responsive Bid 

(SCRB)

4 IPL - SG 10Gbps 492,157.43 3,445,102.00
Lowest Calculated

Responsive Bid 
(LCRB)

1. Declare Converge ICT Solutions, Inc. for the procurement project titled, Supply, Delivery and Instal-
lation of Seven (7) Month Local Transport UP Mintal Mindanao Primary 10Mbps as the bidder 
with Single Calculated Responsive Bid, with a total bid price amounting to Sixty-Four Thousand One 
Hundred Forty-Eight 64,148.00);

2. Declare Converge ICT Solutions, Inc. for the procurement project titled, Supply, Delivery and Instal-
lation of Seven (7) Month IPL - SG 10Gbps as the bidder with Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid, 
with a total bid price amounting to Three Million Four Hundred Forty-Five Thousand One Hundred 
Two Pesos Only 3,445,102.00);

3.

4.

Digitally signed 
by Alvin E. 
Retamar



Digitally signed by 
Raro Ramon Vann 
Cleff Bornales

Digitally signed by 
Meryl Regine L. 
Algodon

Renz
Typewriter
for 

Alexis
Oval
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